
For your child’s safety and health. WARNING. Instructions for use: • Remove all 
parts to clean and sterilize before each use. •  Before first use, place in boiling water 
for 5 minutes. This is to ensure hygiene. Inspect before each use and pull the feeding 
teat in all directions. Throw away at the first signs of damage or weakness. • Sterilize 
the parts before use. • Do not use abrasive cleaning materials or chemicals. • Only use 
soft bristle brushes or soft sponges. Do not use hard scourers that could scratch the 
plastic and printing. • Sterilize through steam sterilization either electric or microwave 
sterilizers following manufacturer’s instructions. • After sterilizing remove all parts from 
the sterilizer. Do not leave them inside the sterilizer. Do not leave bottle parts in direct 
sunlight or heat. • Do not use pin or sharp object to enlarge the feeding hole. Heating 
instructions: • DO NOT pour boiling water into the bottles. • Remove the protective 
cap and teat before heating. The bottle must not be sealed when heating or cooling 
specially inside a microwave or bottle warmer. Stir to distribute heating. Always check 
food temperature before feeding. Warning/Caution: • This bottle must always be 
handled by an adult or under the supervision of an adult. • Continuous and prolonged 
sucking of fluids will cause tooth decay. • Keep all parts out of children reach if not in 
use. Never use feeding teats as a soother. • Always inspect the bottle carefully before 
each use.• Glass bottles may break. • Sudden temperature changes can cause glass 
bottle to crack or break. Make sure the bottle and liquid are at the same temperature 
when filling or warming. • Do not use metal tools with the bottle for stirring and 
cleaning. This can damage the glass on the bottle on the inside or outside. Before each 
use, inspect the bottle carefully for sharp edges, cracks or glass fragments inside the 
bottle and parts. Do not use the bottle if there are any sharp edges, cracks or glass 
fragments in the bottle. 
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